
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR
GAZETTE

No. 2,580 of 15th NOVEMBER, 1990.

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 154 OF 1990.

SAVINGS BANK ACT.

SAVINGS BANK (AMENDMENT) RULES, 1990.

In exercise of the powers conferred on me by Section 14 of the Savings Bank
Act, and of all other enabling powers, I make the following rules—

Title.

1. These rules may be cited as the Savings Bank (Amendment) Rules, 1990.
Amendment to rule 17.

2. Rule 17 of the Savings Bank Rules (hereinafter called "the principal
Rules") is amended in sub-rule (3) by omitting the figure "£30" and
substituting therefor the figure "£100".

Amendment to rule 34.

3. Rule 34 is amended -

(a) by omitting the marginal note and substituting therefor the following
marginal note

"Deposits not exceeding £2,000.";

(b) by omitting in sub-rule (1) the figure '1,000" and substituting
therefor the figure "£2,000".

Amendment to rule 35.

4. Rule 35 in amended –

(a) by omitting the marginal note and substituting therefor the following
new marginal note

"Deposit exceeding £2,000.";



Gibraltar Gazette No. 2,580, Thursday 15th November, 1990.

(b) by omitting the figure "£1,000" and substituting therefor the figure
"£2,000".

Amendment to rule 36.

5. Rule 36 of the principal Rules is amended by omitting in each sub-rule
thereof the figure '1,000" and substituting therefor the figure "£2,000".

Dated this 15th day of November, 1990.

A. CARTER,

Acting Governor.


