
FIRST SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR  
GAZETTE 

No. 2,580 of 15th NOVEMBER, 1990. 
 
 

 
    I ASSENT, 
 
     ANDREW CARTER, 
 
      ACTING GOVERNOR. 
 
      15th November, 1990. 
 
 
 

 

 
 

GIBRALTAR 
 

No. 51 of 1990. 
 

AN ORDINANCE to amend the Business Names Registration 
Ordinance: 

 
ENACTED by the Legislature of Gibraltar. 
 
Title and commencement. 
 
1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Business Names Registration 
(Amendment) Ordinance, 1990, and shall come into effect on a date to be 
appointed by the Governor by Notice in the Gazette. 
 
 
 
Amendment to section 2A. 
 



51 of 1990) Business Names Registration (Amendment) Ordinance, 
1990. 

 
 

 

2. Section 2A of the Business Names Registration Ordinance (hereinafter 
called "the principal Ordinance") is amended— 
 

(a)  by omitting sub-section (1) and substituting therefor the 
following new sub-section— 

 
  "(1) The Registrar of business names shall be the 

person appointed by the Governor for this purpose."; 
 

(b)  in sub-section (3) by inserting after the words "Supreme 
Court" the words "or such other place as the Governor may 
appoint by notice in the Gazette". 

 
Amendment to section 9. 
 
3. Section 9 of the principal Ordinance is amended by omitting the figure 
"£5" and substituting therefor the figure "£250". 
 
Amendment to sections 11, 12(l), 13 and 15(1). 
 
4. Sections 11, l2(1), 13, and 15(l) of the principal Ordinance are amended 
by omitting the figure "£20" in each of those sections and substituting 
therefor the figure "£1,000". 
 
Amendment to section 20 
 
5. Section 20 of the principal Ordinance is amended in sub-section (2) by 
omitting the figure "£5" and substituting therefor the figure “£25”. 
 

_________________ 
 
Passed by the Gibraltar House of Assembly on the 8th day of November, 
1990. 
 

C. M. COOM, 
 

Clerk to the Assembly. 


