
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
 

No. 5163    GIBRALTAR   Thursday 18th July 2024 

 

 

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 116 OF 2024 

 

CIVIL AVIATION (AIR NAVIGATION) REGULATIONS 2009 

 

SMALL UNMANNED AIRCRAFT (MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS) 

(AMENDMENT) NOTICE 2024 
 

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by regulations 51ZA, 51ZC and 93 of the Civil 

Aviation (Air Navigation) Regulations 2009, the Minister has issued the following Notice- 
 

Title. 

 
1.  This Notice may be cited as the Small Unmanned Aircraft (Miscellaneous Provisions) 

(Amendment) Notice 2024. 

 

Commencement. 

 

2.  This Notice comes into operation on 1 August 2024. 

 

Amendments to Notice. 

 

3.  The Small Unmanned Aircraft (Miscellaneous Provisions) Notice 2020 is amended as 

follows- 

 

(a) in paragraph 5 for “£344” substitute “£352.50”; 

 

(b) in paragraph 7 for “£57.50” substitute “£59.00”; 

 

(c) for the Schedule substitute- 

 

“SCHEDULE 

 

AREA COVERED ISSUE FEE RENEWAL FEE* 

Europa Point £23.50 £12 

Catalan Bay £23.50 £12 

Little Bay £23.50 £12 

Rosia Bay £23.50 £12 

Sandy Bay £23.50 £12 

Other areas  £88 £59 

 

*Renewal fees shall only be applicable if paid before the date of expiry of a valid permission.”. 
 

 

 



Gibraltar Gazette, No. 5163, Thursday 18th July 2024 

 

 2

 

Dated: 18th July 2024. 

 

 

 

 

 

DR J GARCIA, 

Minister with responsibility for Civil Aviation. 
 

 

 

_______________________________________________________ 

 

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM 

 

This Notice revises the Schedule of fees in line with the Chief Minister’s 2024 Budget 

Statement. 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


