
FIRST SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR  

GAZETTE 
No. 2,556 of 14th JUNE, 1990. 

 

 

 

   I ASSENT, 

 

      DEREK REFFELL, 

 

         

       GOVERNOR. 

         

       14th June, 1990. 

 

 

 

 

 
 

GIBRALTAR 

 

No. 27 of, 1990. 

 

AN ORDINANCE to amend the Firearms Ordinance. 

  

ENACTED by the Legislature of Gibraltar. 

 

Title. 

 

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Firearms (Amendment) Ordinance, 

1990. 

 

Amendment to Section 3. 

 

2. Section 3 of the Firearms Ordinance (hereinafter referred to as "the 

principal Ordinance") is amended in sub-section (2)(b) by omitting the figure 

''£100" and substituting therefor the figure “£1,000". 



27 of 1990.] Firearms (Amendment) Ordinance, 1990. 

 

 

 

 

Amendment to Section 4. 

 

3. Section 4 of the principal Ordinance is amended as follows— 

 

(a)  in sub-section (9) by omitting the figure "£20" and substituting 

therefor the figure "£ 100"; 

 

(b)  in sub-section (10) by omitting the figure "£20" and 

substituting therefor the figure "£ 1,000". 

 

Amendment to Section 5. 

 

4. Section 5 of the principal Ordinance is amended— 

 

(a)  in subsection (1)(a) by omitting the figure "£5" and 

substituting therefor the figure "£20"; 

 

(b)  in subsection (1) (b) by omitting the figure "£3" and 

substituting therefor the figure "£15"; 

 

(c)  in subsection (1)(c) by omitting the figure "£2" and 

substituting therefor the figure "£10". 

 

Amendment to Section 6. 

 

5. Section 6 of the principal Ordinance is amended— 

 

(a)  in subsection (4)(a) by inserting the words "reasonably 

necessary for the protection" after the word "equipment"; 

 

(b)  in sub-section (12) by omitting the figure "£20" and 

substituting therefor the figure "£500". 

 

 

Amendment to Section 8. 

 

6. Section 8 of the principal Ordinance is amended in sub-section (3) by 

omitting the figure "£20" and substituting therefor the figure “£1,000”. 

 

Amendment to Section 9. 



27 of 1990.] Firearms (Amendment) Ordinance, 1990. 

 

 

 

 

7. Section 9 of the principal Ordinance is amended in sub-section (2) by 

omitting the figure "£20" and substituting therefor the figure “£1,000". 

 

Amendment to Section 10. 

 

8. Section 10 of the principal Ordinance is amended— 

 

(a)  in subsection (2) by omitting the figure "£40" and substituting 

therefor the figure "£50"; 

 

(b)  in subsection (6) by omitting the figure "£20" and substituting 

therefor the figure "£1,000". 

 

Amendment to Section 11. 

 

9. Section 11 of the principal Ordinance is amended— 

 

(a)  in sub-section (2)(c) by omitting the figure "£3" and 

substituting therefor the figure "£50"; 

 

(b)  in sub-section (4) by omitting the figure "£20" and substituting 

therefor the figure "£500". 

 

Amendment to Section 12. 

 

10. Section 12 of the principal Ordinance is amended in sub-section 

(5) by omitting the figure "£20" and substituting therefor the figure “£100".  

 

Amendment to Section 13. 

 

11. Section 13 of the principal Ordinance is amended in sub-section (4) by 

omitting the figure "£20" and substituting therefor the figure “£1,000”. 

 

Amendment to Section 14. 

 

12. Section 14 of the principal Ordinance is amended in sub-section (4) by 

omitting the figure "£20" and substituting therefor the figure “£1,000”. 

 

Amendment to Section 16. 

 



27 of 1990.] Firearms (Amendment) Ordinance, 1990. 

 

 

 

13. Section 16 of the principal Ordinance is amended in sub-section (2) by 

omitting the figure "£20" and substituting therefor the figure "£500". 

 

Amendment to Section 18. 

 

14. Section 18 of the principal Ordinance is amended as follows— 

 

(a)  in sub-section (2) by omitting the figure "£20" and substituting 

therefor the figure "£1,000"; 

 

(b)  in sub-section (6) by omitting the figure "£20" and substituting 

therefor the figure "£100". 

 

Amendment to Section 19. 

 

15. Section 19 of the principal Ordinance is amended in sub-section (4) by 

omitting the figure "£20" and substituting therefor the figure “£1,000". 

 

Amendment to Section 20. 

 

16. Section 20 of the principal Ordinance is amended in sub-section (4) by 

omitting the figure '£100" and substituting therefor the figure "£ 1,000". 

 

Amendment to Section 21. 

 

17. Section 21 of the principal Ordinance is amended in sub-section (2) by 

omitting the figure "£100" and substituting therefor the figure "£1,000". 

 

Amendment to Section 22. 

 

18. Section 22 of the principal Ordinance is amended in Section (5) by 

omitting the figure "£100" and substituting therefor the figure “£1,000". 

 

Amendment to Section 25. 

 

19. Section 25 of the principal Ordinance is amended— 

 

(a)  in sub-section (3) by— 

 

  (i)  omitting the figure '£100" and substituting therefor the 

figure "£1,000"; 



27 of 1990.] Firearms (Amendment) Ordinance, 1990. 

 

 

 

 

 (ii) omitting the figure "£50" and substituting therefor the 

figure "£500"; 

 

(b)  in sub-section (4)(a) by omitting the figure "£100" and 

substituting therefor the figure "£1,000". 

 

Amendment to Section 28. 

 

20. Section 28 of the principal Ordinance is amended in sub-section (1) by 

omitting the figure "£20" and substituting therefor the figure “£1,000”. 

 

Amendment to Section 29. 

 

21. Section 29 of the principal Ordinance is amended in sub-section (2)(c) by 

omitting the figure "£20" and substituting therefor the figure "£100". 

 

Amendment to Section 31. 

 

22. Section 31 of the principal Ordinance is amended in sub-section (3) by 

omitting the figure "£100" and substituting therefor the figure "£1,000". 

 

________________ 

 

Passed by the Gibraltar House of Assembly on the 30th day of May, 1990. 

 

C. M. COOM 

 

Clerk to the Assembly. 

 


