SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR
GAZETTE

No. 5074 GIBRALTAR Thursday 27th July 2023

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 221 OF 2023

LASTING POWERS OF ATTORNEY AND CAPACITY ACT 2018
LASTING POWERS OF ATTORNEY (REGISTRATION) (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS 2023
In exercised of the powers conferred upon him by section 15 of the Lasting Powers of

Attorney and Capacity Act 2018, the Minister has made the following Regulations-

Title.

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Lasting Powers of Attorney (Registration)
(Amendment) Regulations 2023.

Commencement.
2. These Regulations come into operation on 1 August 2023.
Amendment to regulations.

3. Schedule 3 to the Lasting Powers of Attorney (Registration) Regulations 2018 is amended
as follows-

(a) in paragraph 1 for “£100” substitute “£118.50;
(b) in paragraph 2 for “£50” substitute “£59.50”;
(c) in paragraph 3 for “£25” substitute “£29.50”;

(d) in paragraph 4 for “£10” substitute “£11.50”.

Dated: 27" July 2023.

A JISOLA,
Minister with responsibility for Health.



Gibraltar Gazette, No. 5074, Thursday 27th July 2023

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM

These Regulations amend the fees payable in line with Budget Statements.



