
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR
GAZETTE

No. 3339 of 2 May, 2003

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 48 OF 2003

LICENSING AND FEES ACT

LICENCE (FEES) (AMENDMENT) RULES 2003

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 51 of the Licensing
and Fees Act the Governor has made the following rules–

Title and commencement.

1.  These rules may be cited as the Licence (Fees) (Amendment) Rules 2003,
and come into operation on 1 May 2003.

Amendment of Schedule 2 Paragraph 5 of the Licensing (Fees) Rules
1991.

2.  Schedule 2 of the Licensing (Fees) Rules 1991 is amended in paragraph 5
(Passport fees) as follows–

(a) sub–paragraph (a)(i) and (ii) are amended by substituting for
the figures “£30.00” and “£16.00”, the figures “£33.00” and
“£19.00” respectively;

(b) sub–paragraph (d) is amended by substituting for the figure
“£18.00”, the figure “£22.50”;

(c) sub–paragraph (e) is amended by substituting for the figure
“£18.00”, the figure “£22.50”.

Dated the 2nd day of May, 2003.

By Command,

D G BLUNT,

Deputy Governor

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 3339, Thursday 2 May, 2003

2

These rules increase the fees payable for passport issue in line with recent
increases in the UK.


