
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR
GAZETTE

No. 3445 of 23 December, 2004

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 136 OF 2004

LICENSING AND FEES ACT

LICENSING (AMENDMENT) RULES 2004

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 51 of the Licensing
and Fees Act, the Governor has made the following rules–

Title and commencement.

1. These rules may be cited as the Licensing (Amendment) Rules 2004 and
come into operation on 1 January 2005.

Amendments to Schedule 2 to the Licensing Rules.

2.(1) Paragraph 3 of Schedule 2 to the Licensing Rules is amended as
follows–

(a) sub-paragraph (b) is amended by substituting for the word
“Dependent” the word “Overseas” and by substituting for the
figures “£120.00” the figures “£85.00”;

(b) sub-paragraph (c) is amended by substituting for the word
“Dependent” the word “Overseas” and by substituting for the
figures “£120.00” the figures “£144.00”;

(c) sub-paragraph (d) is amended by substituting for the word
“Dependent” the word “Overseas”;

(d) sub-paragraph (e) is amended by substituting for the word
“Dependent” the word “Overseas” and by substituting for the
figures “£120.00” the figures “£146.00”.

(a) sub-paragraph (f) is amended by substituting for the word
“Dependent” the word “Overseas” and by substituting for the
figures “£20.00” the figures “£81.00”.



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 3445, Thursday 23 December, 2004

1080

(2) Paragraph 5 of Schedule 2 to the Licensing Rules is amended as
follows–

(a) sub-paragraph a (i) and (ii) are amended by substituting for the
figures “£33.00” and “£19.00”, the figures “£42.00” and
“£25.00” respectively;

(b) sub-paragraph (d) and sub-paragraph (e) are revoked.

(c) sub-paragraph (g) is amended by substituting for the figures
“10.00” the figures “£13.00” and by adding the words “No fee
shall be taken in respect of these services if the applicant is
born on or before 2nd September, 1929”.

(d) at the end of the Note after paragraph (i) after the word
Gibraltar by adding the words” or to a British National born on
or before 2nd September, 1929.”

(e) sub-paragraph (k) is replaced by the following–

“(k) Receiving an application for an entry clearance for the
United Kingdom under the following categories–

CATEGORY
£

Visit (Standard) 36.00

Visit (Multiple Entry):

One Year 60.00

Two Years 70.00

Five Years
Ten Years

88.00
150.00

Medical Treatment: 36.00

Student (irrespective of
length of stay): 36.00

Visitor in transit: 36.00



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 3445, Thursday 23 December, 2004

1081

Direct Airside Transit: 27.00

Joining Ship/Aircraft 36.00

Work Permit (6 months or
under) 36.00

Work Permit (over 6
months) 75.00

“Employment” (6 months
and under) 36.00

“Employment” (over 6
months) 75.00

Self-employed (6 months
and under) 36.00

Self-employed (over 6
months) 75.00

Establish Business 75.00

Retired Person of
Independent Means 75.00

Investor 75.00

UK Grandparent 75.00

Working holiday-maker 36.00

Husband/Wife 260.00

Child for settlement (include.
Adoption) 260.00

Family Reunion 75.00

Marriage 260.00



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 3445, Thursday 23 December, 2004

1082

Certificate of Entitlement 110.00

Sole Representative 75.00

Returning Resident 36.00

Entry Clearance for a
Commonwealth Country 22.00

Entry Clearance for an
Overseas Territory 22.00”

Dated the 23rd day of December, 2004.

By Command,

D G BLUNT,

Deputy Governor.



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 3445, Thursday 23 December, 2004

1083


