
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
No. 3749 of 10 December, 2009 

 

 

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 86 OF 2009. 

 

NATURE PROTECTION ACT, 1991 

 

UPPER ROCK NATURE RESERVE (ADMISSION FEES) 

(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2009 

 

In exercise of the powers conferred upon him by section 24A of the Nature 

Protection Act, 1991, the Minister has made the following Regulations− 

 
Title and commencement. 

 

1.  These Regulations may be cited as the Upper Rock Nature Reserve 

(Admission Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2009 and come into operation 

on 1 January 2010. 

 

Amendment of fees. 

 

2. Regulation 2 of the Upper Rock Nature Reserve (Admission Fees) 

Regulations 2001 is amended− 

 

(a) in paragraph (a) for the figures “£8.00” and “£4.00” substitute 

“£10.00” and “£5.00” respectively; 

 

(b) in paragraph (b) for the figure “£1.50” substitute “£2.00”; 

 

(c) in paragraph (c) for the figure “£4.50” substitute “£5.50”; 

 

(d) in paragraph (d) for the figure “£4.00” substitute “£5.00”; 

 

(e) in paragraph (f) for the figures “£7.50” and “£3.50” substitute 

“£9.50” and “£4.50” respectively; 

 

(f) in paragraph (g) for the figures “£7.00” and “£3.00” substitute 

“£9.00” and “£4.00” respectively. 

 

 

 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 3749, Thursday 10 December, 2009 

 

 1002 

 

Dated 7th December, 2009. 

 

 

 

E M BRITTO, 

Minister for the environment. 

 

__________________ 

 

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM 

 

These Regulations amend the fees payable on admission to the Upper Rock 

Nature Reserve. 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 3749, Thursday 10 December, 2009 

 

 1003 

 

 

 

 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 3749, Thursday 10 December, 2009 

 

 1004 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
Printed by the Gibraltar Chronicle Limited 

Printing Office, 2, Library Gardens, 

Government Printers for Gibraltar, 

Copies may be purchased at 6, Convent Place, Price £0.40p 

 

 


