
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR
GAZETTE

No. 2,156 of  29th March, 1984.

LEGAL NOTICE No. 22 OF 1984.

POST OFFICE ACT.
(Cap. 128).

BRITISH COMMONWEALTH AND FOREIGN PARCEL POST
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 1984.

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by sections 5, 12 and 54 of the
Post Office Act, and of all other enabling powers, the Governor has made the
following regulations:

Title and Commencement.
1. (1) These regulations may be cited as the British Commonwealth and
Foreign Parcel Post (Amendment) Regulations, 1984.

(2) These regulations shall come into operation on the 1st day of April,
1984.

Amendment of regulation 1-5 of booklet 2,of Cap. 128.
2. Regulation 15 of the British Commonwealth and Foreign Parcel Post
Regulations (hereinafter called the principal regulations) is amended by
omitting the words "sixty pence" and substituting the expression "£1.00".

Amendment of regulation 17,(1)
3. Regulation 17(1) (e) (ii) of the principal regulations is amended by
omitting the expression "£1000", and substituting the expression "£80".
Amendment of regulation 17(1) (h) (i).

4. Regulation 17(I) (h) (i) of the principal regulations is amended by omitting
the ward "sixty", and substituting the word "eighty".

Amendment of regulation 18(1).
5. Regulation 18 (1) of the principal regulations is amended in proviso (c) by
omitting the expression "£1000" and substituting the expression "£80".

Amendment of regulatuon 20(2).
6. Regulation 20(2) of the principal regulations is amended by omitting the
words "thirty five" and substituting the word "forty".



Gibraltar Gazette No. 2,156, of Thursday 29th March, 1984.

Replacement of First and Third Schedules.
7. The principal regulations are further amended by revoking the First and
Third Schedules and substituting the following Schedules: -

"FIRST SCHEDULE.
Regulation 4.

"PART I.

"PARCEL POST RATES (SURFACE)

Destination Postage on parcels not exceeding.

By Direct

Services 1 Kilo 3 kilos 5 kilos 10 kilos 15 kilos 20 kilos

United

Kingdom £4.10 £5.56 £7.10 £4.72 £12.97 £15.89

Morocco £1.73 £2.37 £3.01 £4.30 £ 6.16 £ 7.67

"PART Il.

"PARCEL POST RATES (AIRMAIL)

To the United Kingdom: -
Weight Rate Weight Rate

£ p £ p
First ½ Kilo 4.20 6 kg to 6 ½ kg 11.70
over ½  kg to 1kg 4.55 6 ½ kg to 7 kg 12.05
1 kg to 1 ½  kg 5.85 7 kg to 7 ½  kg 12.40
½  kg to 2 kg 6.20 7 ½ kg to 8 kg 12.75
2 kg to 2 ½ kg 6.55 8 kg to 8 ½ kg 13.05
2 ½ kg to 3 kg 6.85 8 ½ kg to 9 kg 13.40
3 kg to 3 ½ kg 8.25 9 kg to 9 ½ kg 13.75
3 ½ kg to 4 kg 8.60 9 ½ kg to 10 kg 14.10
4 kg to 4 ½ kg 8.95 10 kg to 10 ½ kg 16.45
4 ½ kg to 5 kg 9.30 10 ½ kg to 11 kg 16.80
5 kg to 5 ½ kg 11.00 11 kg to 11 ½ kg 17.15

5 ½ kg to 6 kg 11.35 11 ½ kg to 12 kg 17.50



Gibraltar Gazette No. 2,156, of Thursday 29th March, 1984.

12 kg to, 12 ½ kg 17.80 16 kg to 16 ½ kg 22.25

1 ½  kg to 13 kg 18.15 16 ½ kg to 17 kg 22.60

13 kg to 13 ½ kg 18.50 17 kg to 17 ½ kg 22.95

13 ½  kg to 14 kg 18.85 17 ½ kg to 18 kg 23.30

14 kg to 14 ½ kg 19.20 18 kg to 18 ½ kg 23.60

14 ½  kg to 15 kg 19.55 18 ½ kg to 19 kg 23.95

15 kg to 15 ½ kg 21.55 19 kg to 19 ½ kg 24.30

152 kg to 16 kg 21.90 19 ½ kg to 20 kg 24.65

"THIRD SCHEDULE.
Regulations 17 and 18.

"INSURANCE AND COMPENSATION

"PART I

"INSURED PARCELS

Fee Maximum Compensation

20p ... ... ... ... ... £20.00

40p ... ... ... ... ... £35.00
60p ... ... ... ... ... £50.00
80p ... ... ... ... ... £65.00

£1.00 ... ... ... ... ... £80.00

"PART H.

"UNINSURED PARCELS

Weight of Parcel Maximum Compensation



Gibraltar Gazette No. 2,156, of Thursday 29th March, 1984.

Not exceeding 5 kilos ... ... £12.00

Exceeding 5 kilos but not
exceeding 10 kilos ... ... £15.00
Exceeding 10 kilos but not
exceeding 15 kilos ... ... £20.00
Exceeding 15 kilos but not
exceeding 20 kilos ... ... £25.00

Dated this 29th day of March, 1984.

By Command,

J. BROADLEY,

Deputy Governor.


