
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR
GAZETTE

No. 2,590 of 17th JANUARY,  1991.

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 5 OF 1991.

POST OFFICE ACT.

LOCAL POST (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 1991.

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 54 of the Post Office
Act, and of all other enabling powers, the Governor has made the following
regulations—

Title and commencement.

1. These regulations may be cited as the Local Post (Amendment)
regulations, 1991 and shall take effect on the 1st day of February, 1991.

Amendment to regulation 24.

2. Regulation 24 of the Local Post Regulations (hereinafter called “the
principal Regulations”) is amended in subregulation (2) by omitting the
figure “£1.00” and substituting therefor the figure “£1.05”.

Amendment to regulation 29.

3. Regulation 29 of the principal Regulation is amended by omitting the
figure “£15” and substituting therefor the figure “£18”.

Amendment to Schedule 1.

4. Schedule 1 to the principal Regulations is amended—

(a) in item 1 by omitting the entries in column 3 and substituting the
following 2 new entries—

“Maximum: length, width and depth combined: 900mm, but the greatest
dimension may not exceed 600mm with a tolerance of 2 mm. Minima: to
have a surface measuring not less than 90x140 mm with a tolerance of 2 mm.
In roll form, maxima: length plus twice the diameter, 1040mm but the
greatest dimension may not exceed 900mm with a tolerance of 2mm.



Gibraltar Gazette No. 2,590 of 17th JANUARY,  1991.

Minima: length plus twice the diameter, 170mm but the greatest dimension
may not be less than 100mm.”;

(b) in item 2 by omitting the entry in column 3rd substituting therefore
the following new entry—

“maxima: 105x148mm with a tolerance of 2mm.
Minima: 90x140mm with a tolerance of 2mm.”;

(c) in item 8 by omitting the entry in the third column and substituting
therefor the following new entry—

“Sum of length plus girth may not exceed 3 metres.
Greatest dimension may not exceed 1.500mm.”.

Amendment to Schedule 2.

5. Schedule 2 to the principal Regulations is amended—

(a) in item 1 by omitting the figure “20p” and substituting therefor the
figure 30p”;

(b) in item 4 by—

(i) omitting the figure “20p” and substituting therefor the figure
“30p”;

(ii) omitting the figure “25p” and substituting therefor the figure
“35p”;

(c) in item 5 by omitting the figure “40p” and substituting therefor the
figure 48p”;

Dated this 17th day of January, 1991.

By Command,

A. CARTER,

Deputy Governor.



Gibraltar Gazette No. 2,590 of 17th JANUARY,  1991.



Gibraltar Gazette No. 2,590 of 17th JANUARY,  1991.


