
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR
GAZETTE

No. 3427 of 13 September, 2004

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 92 OF 2004.

POST OFFICE ACT

LOCAL POST (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2004

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 54 of the Post Office
Act, and of all other enabling powers, the Governor has made the following
regulations -

Title and commencement.

1.  These regulations may be cited as the Local Post (Amendment)
Regulations 2004, and shall come into effect  on the 13th September 2004.

Amendments to the Local Post Regulations.

2.  The Local Post Regulations, hereinafter referred to as “the principal
Regulations” are amended in accordance with the provisions of these
regulations.

Amendment to regulation 20.

3.  Regulation 20 of the principal Regulations is amended in sub-regulation
(1) by omitting the figure “£1.40” and substituting therefor the figure
“£1.80”.

Amendment to regulation 24.

4.  Regulation 24 of the principal Regulations is amended in sub-regulation
(2) by omitting the figure “£1.20” and substituting therefor the figure
“£1.60”.

Amendment to Schedule 1.

5.  Schedule 1 of the principal Regulation is amended –

(a) in item 1. Letter, in the second column delete the words “for
every 50 grammes or part thereof – 5p” and substitute the



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 3427, Monday 13 September, 2004

544

words “for the first 50 grammes or part thereof – 7p. For every
additional 50 grammes or part thereof – 5p”;

(b) in item 2. Postcard, in the second column delete “5p” and
substitute “7p”;

(c) item 3. Printed packet, is deleted in its entirety;

(d) item 4. Newspapers printed in Gibraltar and addressed to
subscribers in Gibraltar or Spain is amended–

(i) in the first column by deleting the words “or Spain”;

(ii) in the second column by deleting the words “per copy
– 3p.” and substituting the words “for the first 50
grammes or part thereof – 5p. For every additional 50
grammes or part thereof – 5p”;

(e) item 5. Sample packet, is deleted in its entirety;

(f) item 7. Small packet is deleted in its entirety.

Dated the 13th day of September, 2004.

By Command,

Acting Deputy Governor.


